AGENDA

Committee on Public Safety
Wednesday, November 2, 2011
City Council Conference Room, 10™ Floor, City Hall
4:00 p.m.

Councilmember Carol Wood, Chair
Councilmember Tina Houghton, Vice Chair
Councilmember A’Lynne Robinson, Member

L

1L

1.

Iv.

V.

VL

VIL

VIIL

Call to Order

Roll Call

Approval of Minutes
Public Comment
Action/Discussion

A. International Property Maintenance Code

B. Ingham County Board of Commissioners Resolution Authorizing the Appointment of Malekka Maki
as a4 General Public Representative o the Ingham County/City of Lansing Community Corrections

Advisory Board, Term Expiring September 17, 2012
Receipt of Communications
Adjourn

Pending

5:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\2011\111102\111102_ PSF A.doc

11/1/2011

1



[ ]

10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

DRAFT #1
APRIL 27,2011
ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF LANSING, MICHIGAN, TO REPEAL
SECTIONS 1460.01-1460.43 OF THE LANSING CODIFIED ORDINANCES AND REPLACE
THEM WITH NEW SECTIONS 1460.01 AND 1460.02, ADOPTING THE 2009
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE WITH CERTAIN ADDITIONS,
DELETIONS, AND ALTERATIONS.

THE CITY OF LANSING ORDAINS:

Section 1. That Sections 1460.01-1460.43 of the Codified Ordinances of the City of
Lansing, Michigan, be and are hereby repealed and replaced with the following:

CHAPTER 1460. PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

1460.01. PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE.

FOR THE PURPOSE OF REGULATING AND GOVERNING THE CONDITIONS AND
MAINTENANCE OF ALL PREMISES AND ANY STRUCTURES THEREON; PROVIDING
STANDARDS FOR SUPPLIED UTILITIES AND FACILITIES, OTHER PHYSICAL
ASPECTS OF STRUCTURES, AND CONDITIONS ESSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT
STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY, AND FIT FOR OCCUPATION AND USE; AND
PROVIDING A MECHANISM FOR CONDEMNATION OF STRUCTURES UNFIT FOR
HUMAN OCCUPANCY AND USE AND THE DEMOLITION OF SUCH STRUCTURES,
THE 2009 INTERNATIONAT. PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE (“TPMC”) IS HERERY
ADOPTED AS IF FULLY SET FORTH HEREIN, WITH THE FOLLOWING ADDITIONS,

DELETIONS, AND AT TERATIONS:

1
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



[ ]

10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

DRAFT #1

APRIL 27, 2011
(a) WHERE THE IPMC USES “[NAME OF JURISDICTION],” OR “THE JURISDICTION,”
IT SHALL MEAN “LANSING” OR “THE CITY.”
(b) WHERE THE IPMC USES “INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE,” IT SHALL. MEAN
“THE BUILDING CODE, AS ADOPTED IN CHAPTER 1420 OF THE LANSING CODIFIED
ORDINANCES.” WHERE THE IPMC USES “INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAIL CODE”
IT SHALL MEAN “THE MECHANICAL CODE, AS ADOPTED IN CHAPTER 1426 OF THE
LANSING CODIFIED ORDINANCES.” WHERE THE IPMC USES “ICC ELECTRICAL
CODE,” IT SHALL MEAN “THE ELECTRICAL CODE, AS ADOPTED IN CHAPTER 1424
OF THE LANSING CODIFIED ORDINANCES.” WIHERE THE IPMC USES
“INTERNATIONAL ZONING CODE,” IT SHALL MEAN “THE ZONING CODE, BEING
TITLE SIX OF PART TWELVE OF THE LANSING CODIFIED ORDINANCES.” WIERE
THE IPMC USES “INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE,” IT SHALL MEAN “THE FIRE CODE,
AS ADOPTED IN CHAPTER 1610 OF THE LANSING CODIFIED ORDINANCES.”
WHERE THE IPMC USES “INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE,” IT SHALL MEAN
“THE PLUMBING CODE, AS ADOPTED IN CHAPTER 1422 OF THE LANSING
CODIFIED ORDINANCES.”
(¢) THE FOLLOWING LANGUAGE IS ADDED TO SECTION 102.6 AFTER THE WORD
“DESIGNATED”: BY THE FEDERAL, STATE, OR LOCAL GOVERNMENT.
(d) WHERE THE TPMC UTJSES “DEPARTMENT OF PROPERTY MAINTENANCFE
INSPECTION” OR “DEPARTMENT” IT SHALL MEAN “OFFICE OF CODE

COMPLIANCE.”

(c) SECTION 103.2 IS DELETED.

2
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



[ ]

10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

DRAFT #1

APRIL 27, 2011
() SECTION 103.3 SHALL READ: THE CODE OFFICIAL SHALL HAVE THE
AUTHORITY TO APPOINT CODE COMPLIANCE OFFICERS. THE CODE OFFICIAL
SHALL ALSO HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO DELEGATE TO ANY CODE COMPLIANCE
OFFICER ANY OF HIS OR HER DUTIES UNDER THIS CODE AND ANY OF THE
FUNCTIONS THIS CODE AUTHORIZES HIM OR HER TO PERFORM.
(g) WHERE THE IPMC USES “LEGAL REPRESENTATIVE OF THE JURISDICTION,”
“LEGAL OFFICER OF THE JURISDICTION,” OR “LEGAL COUNSEL OF TIIE
JURISDICTION,” IT SHALL MEAN “CITY ATTORNEY.”
(h) SECTION 103.5 SHALL READ: THE FEES FOR ACTIVITIES AND SERVICES
PERFORMED BY THE OFFICE OF CODE COMPLIANCE IN CARRYING OUT ITS
TUNCTIONS UNDER THIS CODE SHALL BE ESTABLISHED BY COUNCIL
RESOLUTION.
(i) THE FOLLOWING LANGUAGE IS ADDED TO THE END OF SECTION 104.1: THE
OFFICE OF CODE COMPLIANCE IS RESPONSIBLE FOR ENFORCING THIS CODE AND
ACTS AS THE LOCAL HEALTH DEPARTMENT UNDER PART 24 OF THE PUBLIC
HEALTH CODE, BEING PA 368 OF 1978. NOTHING IN THIS CODE SHALL BE
CONSTRUED AS PREVENTING THE OFFICE OF CODE COMPLIANCE FROM
ENFORCING ANY PROVISION OF THE HOUSING LAW OF MICHIGAN, BEING PA 167
OF 1917.
(3) WHERE THE IPMC USES “APPOINTING AUTHORITY,” IT SHALL MEAN

“MAYOR.”

3
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



[ ]

10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

DRAFT #1

APRIL 27, 2011
(k) THE FOLLOWING LANGUAGE IS ADDED TO THE END OF SECTION 106.1:
UNLESS A PROVISION OF THIS CODE STATES THAT A PERSON OTHER THAN THE
OWNER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR A VIOLATION, THE OWNER IS RESPONSIBLE, EVEN
WHERE THIS CODE IMPOSES AN ADDITIONAL DUTY ON THE OCCUPANT OR
WHERE THE OWNER HAS IMPOSED THE DUTY OF COMPLIANCE WITH THIS CODE
ON THE OCCUPANT BY AGREEMENT.
(1) SECTION 106.3 SHALL READ: THE CODE OFFICIAL AND ALL CODE
COMPLIANCE OFFICERS ARE HEREBY DESIGNATED AS AUTHORIZED CITY
OFTICIALS FOR THE PURPOSE OF ISSUING MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTION
NOTICES DIRECTING ALLEGED VIOLATORS TO APPEAR AT THE CITY OF LANSING
MUNICIPAL ORDINANCE VIOLATIONS BUREAU OR A LOCAL COURT OF
COMPETENT JURISDICTION. UNLESS OTHERWISE PROVIDED IN THIS CODE OR BY
STATE LAW, ANY PERSON IN VIOLATION OF ANY PROVISION OF THIS CODE IS
RESPONSIBLE FOR A MUNICIPAL CIVIL INFRACTION AND SUBJECT TO A $500 FINE
AND ALL OTHER PENALTIES AND REMEDIES ALLOWED BY LAW. ANY PERSON IN
VIOLATION OF SECTION 108.4.1 OR SECTION 108.5 IS RESPONSIBLE FOR A
MISDEMEANOR AND SUBJECT TO THE PENALTIES PROVIDED IN SECTION 202.99(b)
OF THE LANSING CODIFIED ORDINANCES. IF A VIOLATION OF THIS CODE IS NOT
CORRECTED AS REQUIRED BY THE NOTICE OF VIOLATION GIVEN PURSUANT TO
SECTION 107, THE CODE OFFICIAL MAY INSTITUTE THE APPROPRIATE

PROCEEDING AT TLAW OR IN EQUITY TO RESTRAIN, CORRECT, OR ARATE SUCH

VIOLATION; OR TO REQUIRE THE REMOVAL OR TERMINATION OF ANY

4
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



[ ]

10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

DRAFT #1

APRIL 27, 2011
UNLAWFUL OCCUPANCY OF THE STRUCTURE. HOWEVER, THE CODE OFFICIAL
SHALL HAVE THE AUTHORITY TO GRANT AN EXTENSION OF THE TIME SPECIFIED
IN THE NOTICE OF VIOLATION UPON REQUEST BY THE PERSON RESPONSIBLE
FOR THE VIOLATION, PROVIDED THAT THE PERSON AGREES TO CORRECT THE
VIOLATION WITHIN THE EXTENDED TIME PERIOD TO BE GRANTED AND THE
CODE OFFICIAL DETERMINES THAT A CONDITION DANGEROUS TO LIFE OR
PROPERTY WILL NOT BE CREATED OR PERPETUATED BY GRANTING SUCH
EXTENSION. NO SUCH EXTENSION OF TIME FOR THE CORRECTION OF A
VIOLATION SHALL EXTEND THE TIME FOR FILING AN APPEAL.
(m) SECTION 106.6 IS ADDED, TO READ AS FOLLOWS: VIOLATIONS OF SECTION
302.4 AND VIOLATIONS OF SECTION 307 ARE HEREBY DECLARED TO BE
NUISANCES AND MAY BE ABATED BY THE CITY IF NOT CORRECTED WITHIN THE
TIME PROVIDED IN THE NOTICE GIVEN PURSUANT TO SECTION 107. ANY
EXPENSE INCURRED IN ABATING A NUISANCE PURSUANT TO THIS SECTION,
INCLUDING AN ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICE FEE, SHALL BE PAID BY THE OWNER
OR PARTY IN INTEREST WHOSE NAME APPEARS ON THE CITY’S REAL PROPERTY
TAX ASSESSMENT RECORDS. THE OWNER OR PARTY IN INTEREST WHOSE NAME
APPEARS ON THE CITY’S REAL PROPERTY TAX ASSESSMENT RECORDS SHALL BE
NOTIFTED OF THE AMOUNT OWED BY FIRST CILASS MATI, AT THE ADDRESS
SHOWN ON THE CITY’S REAL PROPERTY TAX ASSESSMENT RECORDS. AFTER 30

DAYS, ANY UNPATD AMOUNT SHATI BE REPORTED TO THE CITY ASSESSOR FOR

PLACEMENT ON THE NEXT TAX ROLL OF THE CITY AND IT SHALL BE A LIEN

5
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



[ ]

10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

DRAFT #1

APRIL 27, 2011
ASSESSED AGAINST THE PROPERTY ON WHICH THE NUISANCE WAS LOCATED
AND COLLECTED IN THE SAME MANNER AS TAXES, AS PERMITTED BY STATE
LAW.
(n) IN SECTION 107.2:
(1) THE FOLLOWING LANGUAGE IS ADDED TO THE END OF NUMBER 4: FOR
VIOLATIONS OF SECTION 302.4, THE NOTICE SHALL REQUIRE CORRECTION
WITHIN 7 DAYS.
(2) NUMBER 6 IS DELETED.
(o) IN SECTION 107.3, THE LANGUAGE “IFF THE NOTICE IS RETURNED SHOWING
THAT THE LETTER WAS NOT DELIVERED, A COPY THEREOF SHALL BE” IS
DELETED FROM NUMBER 3.
(p) THE FOLLOWING LANGUAGE IS ADDED TO THE END OF SECTION 108.1.1: ANY
STRUCTURE THAT IS A “DANGEROUS BUILDING,” AS DEFINED IN MCL 125.539,
SHALL ALSO BE CONSIDERED AN UNSAFE STRUCTURE.
(q) SECTION 108.8 IS ADDED, TO READ AS FOLLOWS: THE OWNER OF ANY
STRUCTURE UPON WHICH A PLACARD IS POSTED PURSUANT TO SECTION 108.4
SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR PAYING A MONTHLY, NON-REFUNDABLE
ADMINISTRATIVE FEE WHILE THE PLACARD REMAINS ON THE STRUCTURE. THE
ADMINISTRATIVE FEE SHALT, BE ESTABLISHED BY COUNCIT, RESOLUTION IN AN
AMOUNT SUFFICIENT TO DEFRAY THE COST INCURRED BY THE CITY TO

MONITOR THE STRUCTURE FOR THE PURPOSE OF PREVENTING PURLIC SAFETY

HAZARDS. THE OWNER OR PARTY IN INTEREST WHOSE NAME APPEARS ON THE

6
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



[ ]

10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

DRAFT #1

APRIL 27, 2011
CITY’S REAL PROPERTY TAX ASSESSMENT RECORDS SHALL BE NOTIFIED OF THE
AMOUNT OWED BY FIRST CLASS MAIL AT THE ADDRESS SHOWN ON THE CITY’S
REAL PROPERTY TAX ASSESSMENT RECORDS. ANY FEES THAT ACCRUE UNDER
THIS SECTION AND REMAIN UNPAID FOR 30 DAYS SHALL BE REPORTED TO THE
CITY ASSESSOR FOR PLACEMENT ON THE NEXT TAX ROLL OF THE CITY AND
SHALL BE A LIEN ASSESSED AGAINST THE PROPERTY AND COLLECTED IN THE
SAME MANNER AS TAXES, AS PERMITTED BY STATE LAW.
(r) SECTION 108.9 IS ADDED, TO READ AS FOLLOWS: THE CODE OFFICIAL MAY
REQUEST PERMISSION TO INSPECT ANY STRUCTURE INTENDED TO BE USED AS A
DWELLING WHEN THAT STRUCTURE HAS REMAINED VACANT FOR 180 DAYS.
THE CODE OFFICIAL MAY CONTINUE TO REQUEST PERMISSION TO INSPECT THE
STRUCTURE WHILE IT REMAINS VACANT. IF PERMISSION TO INSPECT IS DENIED,
THE CODE OFFICIAL MAY OBTAIN A WARRANT FROM A COURT OF COMPETENT
JURISDICTION.
(s) WHERE THE IPMC USES “APPEALS BOARD,” IT SHALL MEAN BUILDING BOARD
OF APPEALS.
(1) SECTION 110 IS DELETED AND REPLACED WITH MCL 125.538-125.542, WITH THE
EXCEPTION OF MCL 125.541c. MCIL. 125.538-125.542, WITH THE EXCEPTION OF MCL
125.541¢c, ARE HEREBY ADOPTED BY REFERENCE. PURSUANT TO MCT. 125.534(6),
REGARDLESS OF WHETHER OR NOT THE COST OF REPAIR OF A STRUCTURE

EXCEEDS THE STATE EQUALIZED VALUE OF THE STRUCTURE, THE CODE

OFFICIAL MAY BRING A COURT ACTION TO REMOVE OR REHABILITATE A

7
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



[ ]

10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

DRAFT #1

APRIL 27, 2011
STRUCTURE (1) THAT IS AN UNSAFE STRUCTURE PURSUANT TO SECTION 108.1.1,
(2) REMAINS EITHER VACANT OR BOARDED, AND (3) A SIGNIFICANT ATTEMPT
HAS NOT BEEN MADE TO REHABILITATE THE STRUCTURE FOR A PERIOD OF 24
CONSECUTIVE MONTHS.
(uw) SECTION 111.1 SHALL READ: APPEAL OF A DECISION THAT A STRUCTURE IS A
“DANGEROUS BUILDING” PURSUANT TO MCL 125.542 SHALL FOLLOW THE
PROCEDURES ADOPTED IN SECTION 1460.01(u) OF THE LANSING CODIFIED
ORDINANCES. OTHERWISE, ANY PERSON DIRECTLY AFFECTED BY A DECISION
OF THE CODE OFFICIAL OR A NOTICE OR ORDER ISSUED UNDER THIS CODE
SHALL HAVE THE RIGHT TO APPEAL TO THE BUILDING BOARD OF APPEALS. THE
CODE OFFICIAL SHALL BE AN EX-OFFICIO MEMBER OF THE BUILDING BOARD OF
APPEALS, BUT THE CODE OFFICIAL SHALL HAVE NO VOTE ON ANY MATTER
BEFORE THE BOARD. WRITTEN APPLICATION FOR AN APPEAL MUST BE FILED
WITHIN 20 DAY'S OF SERVICE OF THE DECISION, NOTICE, OR ORDER BEING
APPEALED. AN APPLICATION FOR APPEAL MUST BE BASED ON A CLAIM THAT
THE TRUE INTENT OF THIS CODE OR THE RULES LEGALLY ADOPTED
THEREUNDER HAVE BEEN INCORRECTLY INTERPRETED, THE PROVISIONS OF
THIS CODE DO NOT APPLY, OR THE PURPOSES OF THIS CODE’S REQUIREMENTS
ARE ADEQUATELY FULFIT.ILED BY OTHER MEANS.

(v) SECTIONS 111.2-111.7 ARE DELETED.

(w) THE FOLLOWING DEFINITIONS ARE ADDED TO SECTTON 202:

8
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



[ ]

10

11

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

DRAFT #1

APRIL 27, 2011
ABSENTEE LANDLORD. ANY OWNER OF RENTAL PROPERTY WHOSE PRINCIPAL
RESIDENCE IS LOCATED MORE THAN FORTY (40) MILES FROM THE CORPORATE
LIMITS OF THE CITY.
CODE COMPLIANCE OFFICER. ANY DULY AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OF
THE CODE OFFICIAL.
DWELLING. ANY “DWELLING,” AS DEFINED IN MCL 125.402(1), BEING SECTION
2(1) OF THE HOUSING LAW OF MICHIGAN.
LEASEHOLD. ANY “LEASEHOLD,” AS DEFINED BY MCL 125.526(15)(b).
OWNER’S DESIGNATED AGENT. ANY PERSON AUTHORIZED, EITHER
EXPRESSLY ORIMPLIEDLY, BY THE OWNER OF PROPERTY TO ACT FOR, ON
BEHALF OF, OR IN THE PLACE OF THE OWNER.
RENTAL PROPERTY. ANY DWELLING WHICH IS NOT OCCUPIED ON A DAILY
BASIS BY THE OWNER AND WHICH IS LET FOR OCCUPANCY FOR MORE THAN 30
DAYS TO ANY PERSON.
(x) IN SECTION 302.4, “(JURISDICTION TO INSERT HEIGHT IN INCHES)” SHALL
MEAN “EIGHT INCHES.”
(y) THE FOLLOWING LANGUAGE IS ADDED TO THE END OF SECTION 302.8:
WHERE A VEHICLE UNDER THIS SECTION IS AN ABANDONED VEHICLE, AS
DEFINED BY MCI. 257.252a(2), MCI. 257.252a SHAT.I. BE FOLLLOWED.
(z) IN SECTION 304.14, “DURING THE PERIOD FROM [DATE] TO [DATE]” SHALL

MEAN “BETWEEN MAY AND OCTOBER.”

9
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



[ ]

DRAFT #1
APRIL 27,2011
(aa) IN SECTIONS 602.3 AND 602.4, THE LANGUAGE “DURING THE PERIOD FROM
[DATE] TO [DATE]” IS DELETED.
1460.02. COPY OF 2009 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE FOR
PUBLIC INSPECTION
A COPY OF THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE IS
AVAILABLE FOR PUBLIC INSPECTION IN THE CITY CLERK’S OFFICE.
Section 2. All ordinances, resolutions or rules, parts of ordinances, resolutions or rules
inconsistent with the provisions hereof are hereby repealed.
Section 3. Should any section, clause or phrase of this ordinance be declared to be
invalid, the same shall not affect the validity of the ordinance as a whole, or any part thereof
other than the part so declared to be invalid.

Section 4. This ordinance shall take effect on the 30th day after enactment, unless given

immediate effect by City Council.

Approved as to form:

City Attorney
Dated:

10
S:\Council Support\CtyCncl Committees\PSF\20111111102\ADOPTION OF 2009 IPMC D#1 04.27.11.doc



sag) ~aul Apadoud ayy o sy

JO UONDOSIMUL o) Jo juted o) WoIp 199 2AI] Ajuam] pajeao] sour] Aaadoxd o) jo sjurod mamiaq
2UI[ pUE 5)200s 1U20e[Pe S1) JO UOTSIAIUT ST} JSAIEAT 10] 10100 2y} uo soul] Auadord ayp

£q papunoy are aenuery ayj st saydde sy yowyam 0110] 180100 B U wale 2y ‘w1388 Juadelpe uo
JSLIO)OTT JO UOTSTA ST} JONISQ0 AT[RLINEE [[RIS 55DaT] 10 SII] 101 5107 IST0s pIek juoI) uf (1)

“pIe JUOTY & TTITam 120] 20MT1 JO JYSIOY € PoadXo [[eys a5poy Jo 00us oN (1) piuf e (1)

ST

uoisiA 1eajd 1oy pannbaleare oy | saul)
£3odoxd o) Jo monoasoym Jo yutod
a1 WOy 123) 67 pereoo] saul] Auadord
2y} uo sutod uzamyaq auT| € pue
§13218 1020 [PE A1) JO UOTIOASINUT ST
15a1B2U J0| Ja110d 2yl uo saul| Apedoud
o1} Aq popuneq dIr RNBURLY o)

s1 sarjdde st Yorym 03 107 JAWIOD B TO
BAIR 3l ], 819245 Juade(pe uo $1sL01ouL
TO TOTSIA D) 1ONIISGO ARLINRIT [[RYS
SUIION "SI0 4oUA0) PILY jHod T (T)

ST 09FI

DTTRI) IRNNY2A o) Undo Aem

a1pqnd 12710 10 19015 AUe 01 G0 SULIAUD
10 SUIALIP §)SLI010W 27} JO UOTSIA

ayy Jorugsqo |[eys Auadoad jeuosiad
Mo 10 juymdmbs “oSs quomemo
“aa1) ‘afpor] “aImonals pek oN]
astaopofy fo uoisig fo worpnasqo ()

ST 09FI

"2IMONIS Paso[oua A[AIT)us

J3110 Jo 3eIe3 pasojoua A[amua me

ut yday aq Lew sapo1y2a sojow jo spred
20 SO[AIYDA I0)0UT D[QRSTP/POUnPURGY
‘Buisue] Jo A1) 9y w1 pue|

Jo [eared Aue Jo pred rea1 Jo opIs “quoI]
ay} w paoe|d 10 pasyred aq jou [peys
DOTYDIA IO PRSI I0 PIUOPIRAR
U Spany vy 40 ‘opg Wwodd (Z)

ST 09FI

(g007) apo)y aounuapnngy Aadosg msodoag

apoy aoumeapmpy Gdadodg paaim?)

QAT




010151

1m20elpe sAEMOALIP JO $1021)S TO S1SLIOJOTH JO TOTSTA 3T 1001sqo Ajerialew [[eys Joamnt) wed o
yurepd 18130 *201) ‘gruys ou ‘Joara (DH)(1)(g) yderdered Ut paquasep s)2a1s 0] JU0R[PE SALMIATIP
pred oy ayy pue ‘poasay (4(1(4) ydeigeued w paquiosap s1pans 03 Jusorlpe Lemsaup pred
TwoIy o) pue Joazar ((1)(g) ydridrird o1 paqimasop sjo] w0 ped JuoI] Jo eoie o) uf (A1)

ST 0orl

“(ameurpro

STI) JO 1%2) 211 BUIMO[[0] ¢ U185 20G) "ABMSALIP U1 JO 20BLINS ([} WOI] PaInseatu

7231 () 3T 12 puB (£) 22141 U22MI2( 51 SAEMAALIP 10} UOISIA 1E2[D 10§ paimbal gate ay |,
“(oourTTpao ST 0 1xX0) o) SWMO[OT ¢ gMays 905) “(ARmdATIp o)) T0I] ABME) UOT)I0SIVTT
goms o 1297 () T 2UI] 98P0 ARMDALIP o) uo Juiod » ‘ARMOALIP o1)) Jo H5pa opls o) pur

U 10] 21} JO TOTI2sI20UE 271 Jo s10rod a1 Surutol o[Suern e uyiim eae o)) st sardde st gargm
0]10] € JO BaTE 8] OIAJAT]) 1U20L(Pe ALMAATIP € WO oTfIen Jenaryaa o) uado Lem atjgnd Jorio
10 120035 Aue TuLIRUA SISLI0JOW JO UOISIA AU] JorLgsqe K| [euajew [[eys a8pay 1o sduay o (177)

(*20UEUIPIO SIY] JO 18] oY) SUIMO[[Of © yo1aYg

Grpuaddy ¢ gy

225) "ABMAATIP 2T[1 JO SIELINS 27

TIOI] P2INSEATT *J23] Xas pue 129] 2217}
usamjaq 1 SABMAALIP 10} UOISLA 1Ba]d
WOI] PATNbal oIk ST, “UOTIDSIN|UT
Tons TOIJ 129] U2) 2UI] 107 213 Jo 1utod

© pUE UOT)225I2JUT TONS THOT] 123] T2}
auw a3pa femasnp ayy uo juod e woy
A[[ROTIIDA POINSEIUI ‘AEMDALIP DT} O
25pa opls pwe SUY 107 ST} JO UOTIOSIAITT
a1 Jo 1utod ay) Suriol aj3uer

e unim eage ayg st sardde syl yamgm
01 10] B JO IR DY 00T juaoklpe
ABRMDALIP P TIOI] OTJRI) IRNOTYOA

o1 uado Aem orjqud Jati0 10 12278 Aue
SUII2]U2 $1STI0J0T JO TOTSIA 371 JONTSq0
Ajeusyew peys Guylop sdomaars(q (z)
‘(xapuaddyy

UL 7 yopag 2a%) “uoipssia

A 0 199] 0§ TIYITM UOTIEAD]D

152MO] 211 WoIJ A[JeST)ISA PaINSEatH
122] J[BI2 PUT J22] 22101 T22M13q

9roort

91T09rl

(9007) 2poy aoupuannopy Qaadosg sodosg

apo) adupuapInpy Qiadosg jmasin?)

AT




“0UBISOP

127 10 SIY 10 JS2UISUT] OIJeL] Y} pue Uolslal(f Sutuueld a1 Aq peaoxdde st ued oy (5)

-ue[d 2t} 03 102lqo 10U Op A1)} 1eY) JUSWIR]S USYLIM € JTqns sisumo Apadord Sumnge [y ()
“joaiay (7)(y)

pue (1)(v) sydeideird qom so1pdmos pue §)S1I010T JO TOISIA O] 19NISq0 10T S0P 25pag o], (£)
‘sosodind [etnsnpur oy pasn st Autadord Sumnge 2 Jo ‘mepd sarsuagorduon

a1 £q paunap se ‘[eraye [edoud 1o [eLse Iouru 10109[[0d © sI peol Fuipnge au1 (7)

apw) FuIoy DY} 10 Oy (6T | U0nass

ur )07 198 sk sur(d Suang pur Suuoaras ‘Surdeospue] 107 sjustranmbag o) qm sarjdumos
oM TR[d THIM B UOTSTAY] SUme] [ o) 0] $)Tmgns pue saiedaid mumo Auandoid oq7 (1)
:sjuawarmbar SULMOT[0] 71 JO [[& §120W 25pay oY1 It

189] 2211) 2A0QE JYSIY © 0] PAUTRIUICTT Jo TM0IE ‘pajueld oq Aew preA JUOIJ & UT M 35paf] (14)

T 09% 1

“SYTEAMSPIS
aoelpe mo orren meinsapad Jo Jo sdem o17qnd Jo s)2ans Juede(pe U0 STTET) SO[ITYSA JO MOTA
ay3 1anugsqe 03 s os aj3ue Lue woly pa3onysqo £[ELsiEw Jou s aoudy 2yl yInou uoisip ()

0] 29IY) JO 1A B 9A0QR DOR[NS 1 FUOTR

paingunsip Ajumoriun s20eds uado Jo 1u201ad SATJ-AJUSASS ISES] 1€ JO SISTSU00 20US) o] (1)
:sawaIInbal SUTMOT[O] 513 JO € $193T0 20u3] a1} IT 133] InoJ Jo JYS1ay € paadxs 0} 100

nq 123} aauf) saoye WAy € 0] pauleluEw 10 pa1oaus aq Lew pred Juolf ayl uiylim aous) v (A)
(8007) 2poy aoupuanpyy Asadosg ppsodosg

apory asupuapnpy Qiadosg juaaim?)

IHdI

arovrl




o1 Aq paaoadde st e Terelet Joqio Aue Jo 2210u02 painod ‘asodwod Harg ‘poosm HuI
YD S[EHSIEW SULMOT[O] 2Y) JO 2I0W JO 2TO JO PAjONIIsued aq [[eys apo7) Suino7 Suisue|
a1 JO (' T6TT Aq Pa12A0d §10Lnsi(] SUTHoZ 213 Ul “1aydey) ST} Japun palonnstod saous
sporaInpy ()

“JUALIND [E3L302)2 AUED J0 auim Jo odAY e 10 2 1081 ‘Al PAGIEG UIBIU0D

[[BYs apo)) Sutunyz SuIsur o) 10 [ 76T TOTINS AQ PAIDAND SIDLNSK SUTHOZ O] UT SO3UAT 0N
SAUD J IRIZT L2 PpAgang ()

9roort

ST 09FI

TOTSTAL(] Autone] [ o) Aq paanzdde st ued oq ] ()

-Auadoxd Suipnge o1 Jo sasn Aq pasaSuepus st Aadord joelgns a1y Jo uednoaoo 1o J2umo

Jo Kfages 1o qyreay Jo ‘Auedord Suminge oy} uey) 12,0 122] arow Jo suo A[ersuad st Aadoxd
102lqns ) Jo AyderSodor oy ‘sesodind Jenuapisamou 107 pasn sT Avradord Sumnge sy (£)
-ue)d ayp 01 alyo Jou op Aoyl Jey) JuswagEys uaLM B Jugns sisumo Auadosd Sumnge ||y (7)
"apa;) Surmoz o) 70 9( Qg U0

ur 10 325 se sued Sunegng pue ‘Guiuasios ‘Surdeospue] 1oJ sjuswmaninbar ay) Y serjdwod
Torgam werd Uy € wotsIAI(] Surtueld a1 01 surwgns pre saredard reumo Auadoxd auy (1)
‘sjuawannbal TuLMO[[0f 3y} JO B §)aa0

11 SSO[UN JYSIT T 193] XIS PAaXs [[RYS PIRA I0I 10 pIRA apls B TN TM 53paf] 1o soua] op (1)

SPIEX Je pue opis (7)

ST 09FI

(g007) apo)y aounuapnngy Aadosg msodoag

apoy aoumeapmpy Gdadodg paaim?)

QAT




